

McLEAN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
April 19, 2022

McLean County
21-00600-00-RS - Government Center Parking Lot

ITEM	UNIT	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	ENGINEERS ESTIMATE		HJ Eppel & Company, Inc		Rowe Construction NO BID		Stark Excavating, Inc NO BID		McLean County Asphalt Co, Inc	
				TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	
HMA SC IL-9.5 Mix C N50	Ton	475	\$130.00	\$61,750.00	\$120.00	\$57,000.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$134.28	\$63,783.00		
Bit Mat'l Tack Ct	Lbs	875	\$2.50	\$2,187.50	\$1.25	\$1,093.75		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1.48	\$1,295.00		
HMA Surf Rem 2	Sq Yd	3,890	\$6.00	\$23,340.00	\$4.75	\$18,477.50		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$6.36	\$24,740.40		
Cl D Patch Ty 4 4	Sq Yd	175	\$100.00	\$17,500.00	\$72.00	\$12,600.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$38.43	\$6,375.25		
				\$104,777.50		\$89,171.25		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$96,193.65		
						-14.89%		-100.00%		-100.00%		-8.19%	

McLean County
21-00600-00-RS - Metcom Parking Lot

ITEM	UNIT	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	ENGINEERS ESTIMATE		HJ Eppel & Company, Inc		Rowe Construction NO BID		Stark Excavating, Inc NO BID		McLean County Asphalt Co, Inc	
				TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	
HMA BC IL-19.0 N50	Ton	180	\$130.00	\$23,400.00	\$125.00	\$22,500.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$124.57	\$22,422.60		
HMA SC IL-9.5 Mix C N50	Ton	140	\$130.00	\$18,200.00	\$130.00	\$18,200.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$145.16	\$20,322.40		
Bit Mat'l Tack Ct	Lbs	860	\$2.50	\$2,150.00	\$1.25	\$1,075.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1.48	\$1,272.80		
HMA Surf Rem 4	Sq Yd	1,270	\$6.60	\$8,255.00	\$6.50	\$8,255.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$9.50	\$12,065.00		
Cl D Patch Ty 4 4	Sq Yd	50	\$100.00	\$5,000.00	\$72.00	\$3,600.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$45.62	\$2,281.00		
Bit Mat'l Bse Cse	Gal	175	\$5.00	\$875.00	\$2.95	\$516.25		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$9.36	\$1,638.00		
Shape & Comp Agg Bse	Sq Yd	500	\$4.00	\$2,000.00	\$5.25	\$2,625.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2.45	\$1,225.00		
				\$59,880.00		\$56,771.25		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$61,226.80		
						-5.19%		-100.00%		-100.00%		2.25%	
Total				\$164,657.50		\$145,942.50		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$157,420.45		
						-11.37%		-100.00%		-100.00%		-4.40%	